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Abstract 

Introduction: Social anxiety disorder is a condition where people feel very anxious in social situations. This has 

been conducted to assess the effectiveness of Emotion-Focused Therapy (EFT) on self-criticism/ reassurance and 

social anxiety symptoms. 

 
Materials and Methods: The statistical population of this cross-sectional study included all the people aged 18-

40 who were diagnosed with social anxiety disorder and referred to a psychological clinic from September to March 

of 2021 in Tehran city-Iran. Fourteen patients were selected using purposive sampling and assigned randomly into 

an equal experimental and control groups. The experimental group received EFT in five 120-minute weekly sessions, 

while the control group did not receive therapy intervention during this period. The Social Phobia Inventory (SPIN) 

and the Forms of Self-Criticizing/Attacking and Self-Reassuring Scale (FSCRS) were used for data collection. We 

analyzed the data through repeated measures ANOVA and SPSS-24. 

 
Results: Emotion-focused therapy effectively reduced the scores of self-criticizing/attacking and self-reassuring 

and social anxiety symptoms (P< 0.001, P< 0.001, respectively). 

 

Conclusion: Our findings highlight the positive role of emotion-focused therapy in improving self-

criticism/reassurance and symptoms of social anxiety in patients with social anxiety disorder. 
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Introduction 
Social anxiety disorder is the experience of 

severe and persistent fear in social or everyday 
situations. In these situations, individuals 
expect others to question and judge their actions 
(1). In certain social situations, these 
individuals fear engaging in behaviors that may 
cause shame or embarrassment (2). Among the 
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various anxiety disorders, this disease is 
common and serious. Approximately 17% of 
people will experience it within one year, and 

approximately 12.1% will experience it during 
their lifetime (3). This disorder occurs early and 
often precedes other disorders, such as anxiety 
disorders, major depression, and alcohol abuse 
(4). The condition rarely improves without 
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treatment, and symptoms persist and often 
become chronic (6). 

These individuals' social, occupational, 
educational, emotional, and general life 

experiences vary widely due to this disorder 
(6). Self-criticism is a negative inner voice 
criticizing and attacking people and their 
actions. Self-criticism contributes to people's 
vulnerability, making them see their actions as 
failures and unable to accept high standards that 
are unattainable for them, all of which 
contribute to feelings of self-worthlessness (7). 

Shahar et al. found that self-criticism functions 
similarly as a shame-regulating coping strategy. 
People who suffer from social anxiety tend to 
be overly self-critical and constantly criticize 
themselves, so they are often unable to admit 
their shortcomings and feel shame. However, 
self-criticism can lead to negative self-

perceptions and anxiety in social situations (8). 
Developing self-belief as a central mechanism 

model reduces self-critical thinking (9).  
Based on this perspective, a recent study 

found that self-confidence is an effective 
defense against the depressive effects of self-
criticism. As observed in previous research, 

self-criticism is significantly reduced by using 
self-belief (11). Matos et al. show that self-
confidence positively relates to a person's 
ability to show compassion daily (12). Other 
research has shown that self-confidence can 
improve self-compassion (13). Therefore, there 
is a positive relationship with well-being and a 
negative relationship with psychology, 

including symptoms of stress, depression, and 
anxiety (14). To reduce social anxiety 
symptoms and ensure progress, it is important 
to focus attention on specific areas during 
treatment (6). 

Emotion-Focused Therapy (EFT) is an 
empirically supported treatment for increasing 

self-confidence, and emotions (15). Social 
anxiety (9,16,17), overcoming shame and 
loneliness (18), anxiety and quality of life 
(19,20), self-criticism and self-soothing (21). 
Therapeutic change occurs when people 
recognize and experience shame rather than 
avoid it. When shame is evoked, the adaptive 

sadness accompanying the previously avoided 
intimacy and lack of self-compassion is 
transformed by harnessing and invoking 
courageous anger (17). These adaptive 
emotions empower people with social anxiety 
and help them cope with unmet needs 
throughout their lives. This allows them to 

strengthen or rebuild relationships and build 
lives of value and purpose (22). 

The role of emotion regulation in treating this 
condition is not widely explored through 

research. Nevertheless, as social beings, 
humans must have the ability to adapt within 
society to ensure survival. Psychologists are 
always looking for ways to improve social 
interactions between people. Social anxiety 
disorder can disrupt relationships with others 
and pose a threat to daily life. The purpose of 
this study was to evaluate the effectiveness of 

emotion-focused therapy on self-
criticism/reassurance and social anxiety 
symptoms in people diagnosed with social 
anxiety disorder. 
 

Materials and Methods  
The statistical population of this cross-

sectional study included all the people aged 18-
40 who were diagnosed with social anxiety 
disorder and referred to Vian psychological 
clinic from September to March of 2021 in 
Tehran city-Iran. The number of people in each 
group was estimated at seven because of the 

length of the emotional treatment sessions and 
the moral issues of the control group awaiting 
treatment. A total of 14 patients were selected 
using purposive sampling and randomly 
assigned to two equal groups (an experimental 
group and a control group. Based on the opinion 
of Thompson and Girz, who employed an 

emotion-focused therapy group on people's 
levels of self-criticism, they recommended a 6 
to 11-person sample size for the emotion-
focused therapy group (18).  

The inclusion criteria were as follows: 
Obtaining a cutoff score in the Social Phobia 
Inventory (SPIN) (cutoff score= 24), 
confirming the diagnosis of the disorder based 

on the diagnostic clinical interview based on 
SCID-5-CV by a clinical psychologist, and at 
least a diploma education. Furthermore, the 
exclusion criteria were as follows: The 
participant was affected by other psychotherapy 
and counseling programs related to the same or 
other psychological problems, taking 

psychoactive drugs or addictive substances, 
having personality disorders, psychosis, and 
bipolar disorder based on diagnostic interview 
SCID-V, and not attending more than three 
sessions.  

After obtaining permission from the Ethical 
Committee of Guilan University and visiting 

the Vian clinic and all the people who were 
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diagnosed with social anxiety disorder through 
the calls announced in the virtual space from 
September to March 2021 in Tehran (based on 
the research criteria), the people who were 

willing to participate in the research referred to 
Vian clinic in Tehran. Those who declared their 
willingness to participate in the study 
completed a social phobia inventory, and based 
on this questionnaire, those with symptoms of 
social phobia were selected (cutoff score= 24). 
Then, a structured clinical interview based on 
SCID-V was performed to confirm social 

anxiety (22). Then, the participants were 
introduced to the aims, process, and 
consequences of the research. Then, after 
obtaining written consent from the participants, 
they fulfilled the questionnaires in the pre-test 
stage. The experimental group received 
emotion-focused therapy (23) in five 120-

minute weekly sessions (Table 1), while the 
control group was placed on the treatment 
waiting list. After completing the training 
sessions, the experimental and control groups 
were evaluated in post-test stage, and three 
months later, the participants were evaluated in 
the follow-up phase.  

 
Research instruments 

A) The Social Phobia Inventory (SPIN): It 
measures social anxiety/distress, fear, 
physiological symptoms, and avoidance of 
social situations. It contains 17 items and 

consists of three subscales: anxiety, avoidance, 

and physiological symptoms. Each item is 
scored on a scale of 0 to 4 (not at all, somewhat, 
very much, and extremely). Higher scores 
indicate more stress; the total value is between 

0 and 68. Connor et al. reported that internal 
consistency ranged from 0.87 to 0.94 for 
subjects with social phobia and from 0.82 to 
0.090 for controls, with one test-retest. 
Reliability for subjects with social phobia was 
0.89. Validity of the SPIN assessed using 
divergent, convergent, and construct validity 
showed satisfactory results (24). It has good 

psychometric properties for this scale in Iranian 
populations (25). 

B) The Forms of Self-Criticizing/Attacking 
and Self-Reassuring Scale (FSCRS): This 22-
item questionnaire has two subscales: self-
criticism and self-confidence. Responses to 
each item in this scale are defined on a 5-point 

Likert spectrum ranging from "strongly 
disagree" (0) to "strongly agree" (4), with a 
maximum or minimum score between 0 and 88. 
Gilbert et al. reported a reliability coefficient of 
0.90 for this scale. Furthermore, the internal 
consistency coefficient for the self-
criticism/confidence scale was found to be 0.83 

for the entire sample and 0.78 and 0.85 for men 
and women, respectively (26). Saadati et al. 
reported reliability coefficients for the 
questionnaire using Cronbach's alpha and test-
retest methods to be 0.69 and 0.81 for self-
criticism and 0.77 and 0.85 for reassurance, 
respectively (27).

 
Table 1. A technique of emotion-focused therapy model to manage social anxiety disorder  

Content Session 

Setting up a helpful relationship and investigating social uneasiness First 

The first step in intervention is identifying the secondary anxiety processes that underlie the problem. Second 

Using a two-chair approach that confronts the inept self and the critical self, a greater division of the self 

may occur, causing initial feelings of fear versus the critical self (initial maladaptive fear/shame) 
Third 

The practice of empty chair assignments involves revisiting past events that have caused emotional pain 

and unfulfilled longings to overcome them through exercises. 
Fourth 

The general expression of people's experiences in group therapy Fifth 

 
 

  We used descriptive and inferential statistics, 

Box's test, Mauchly's test, ANOVA with 
repeated measures analysis of variance, and 
SPSS-24 to analyze data. 
 

Results 
  In terms of demographic variables, The EFT 

group and the control group aged 26.42± 5.68 

and 25.7±6.52, respectively. Table 2 presents 

the descriptive results related to the self-
criticism/reassurance and social anxiety 
symptoms. There were no significant 
differences in the mean scores of self-
criticism/reassurance and social anxiety 
symptoms between the two groups in the pre-
test stage (P= 0.444, P= 0.137).  
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Table 2. Descriptive indices of the studied variables in pre-test, post-test and follow-up in experimental and 

control groups 

Variables Stage Group Mean ± SD 

 

Self-criticism/Reassurance 

Pre-test 
Emotion- focused therapy 53.85 ± 6.28 

Control 57.51 ± 6.50 

Post-test 

 

Emotion- focused therapy 41.00 ± 3.21 

Control 51.00 ± 6.45 

Follow-up 
Emotion- focused therapy 38.71 ± 2.92 

Control 52.28 ± 5.79 

 

Social anxiety symptoms 

 

Pre-test 

 

Emotion- focused therapy 52.14 ± 6.96 

Control 47.71 ± 11.48 

Post-test 

 

Emotion- focused therapy 19.28 ± 4.27 

Control 46.28 ± 9.69 

Follow-up 
Emotion- focused therapy 19.00 ± 4.54 

Control 47.14 ± 7.22 

The scores of pre-test, post-test, and follow-up 
scores of people in the two experimental and 
control groups are presented in the variables of 
self-criticism/ Reassurance and signs of social 
anxiety. Also, the normal distribution of the 
variables was examined with the Shapiro-Wilk 

test, and considering the non-significance of the 
Shapiro-Wilk test (P> 0.05), the assumption of 
normal distribution of self-criticism/reassurance 
variables and social anxiety symptoms is 
established (Table 3). 

 
Table 3. Box's test for equivalence of covariance matrices 

Variable Box's Test F P 

  Self-criticism/Reassurance 17.05 2.05 0.056 

Social anxiety symptoms 21.90 1.11 0.354 

 

Mauchly's test of sphericity for Self-criticism 

and reassurance indicates that the assumption 
of sphericity has not been violated (X2(2)= 
1.983, P= 0.371). Mauchly's statistic for the 
variable of social anxiety symptoms is 
significant (P< 0.05).  

Therefore, the assumption of sphericity is not 
established for the variable of social anxiety. 

Violating the default assumption of sphericity 

makes the F statistic of the analysis of 

covariance inaccurate. To solve this problem 
and increase the accuracy of the F statistic, the 
degree of freedom is corrected using the 
Greenhouse-Geisser and Huynh-Feldt methods 
(Table 4). Table 5 presents the results of the 
multivariate analysis of the covariance test for 
variables in the two experimental and control 

groups.  
 

Table 4. Mauchly's test to check the sphericity 

Huynh-Feldt Greenhouse-Geisser P 2χ  Mauchly's test Variable 

1 0.858 0.371 1.983 0.835   Self-criticism/Reassurance 

0.668 0.588 0.001 13.280 0.299 Social anxiety symptoms 

 

Table 5. The results of the multivariate analysis of the covariance test for the studied variables in the two 

experimental and control groups 
Eta P F df SS Variable 

0.65 0.001 22.60 2 42.454   Self-criticism/Reassurance 

0.90 0.001 112.22 1.17 905.2607 Social anxiety symptoms 

 

According to the information provided in Table 
5, there is an evident discrepancy in the mean 
scores of self-criticism/ reassurance and its 
elements when comparing the experimental 
group to the control group (P< 0.001). Emotion-

focused therapy reduced self-criticism/ 
reassurance and social anxiety symptoms in the 
experimental group compared to the controls 
(P< 0.001).  
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Discussion  
The study aimed to assess the effectiveness of 

emotion-focused therapy on the self-

criticism/reassurance and symptoms of social 
anxiety. Based on the findings, emotion-focused 
therapy reduced self-criticism/reassurance and 
social anxiety symptoms in the experimental 
group compared to the controls. The findings 
align with previous studies (17-20). Previous 
research has shown that emotion-focused 

therapy can help reduce anxiety and self-
criticism. Some people believe that helping 
people with generalized anxiety disorder 
regulate their emotions and cope with negative 
past experiences can alleviate symptoms and 
avoid potential psychological problems (17,28). 

 Previous research has shown that emotion-

focused therapy can help reduce anxiety and 
self-criticism. Some people believe that helping 
people with generalized anxiety disorder 
regulate their emotions and cope with negative 
past experiences can alleviate symptoms and 
avoid potential psychological problems (17,28).  
Shahar et al. demonstrated that self-criticism is 
conceptualized as a safety strategy aimed at 

hiding mistakes and preventing further 
experiences of shame. However, self-criticism 
leads to negative self-perceptions and anxiety in 
social situations (29). Self‐ criticism is 
positively related to depressive symptoms, 
psychotic symptoms, social anxiety, eating 
disorders, and personality disorders. Therefore, 

self-criticism is a form of self‐ to‐ self 
relationship that appears in several mental health 
difficulties, constituting a vulnerability factor for 
the development of those problems (18). The 
treatment group exhibited decreased anxiety 
levels and improved quality of life, contrasting 
with the control group after undergoing emotion-
focused therapy (17). EFT aims to a) increase 

awareness of adaptive and maladaptive 
emotions, b) improve emotion regulation, c) 
transform maladaptive emotions, and d) reflect 
on adaptive emotions (30). Another possible 
explanation is that participants acquire skills 
over a longer period to reduce feelings of 
personal inadequacy (15,16). 

 This is consistent with the results of a previous 
RCT by Sommers-Spijkerman et al. which 
showed that self-criticism scores continued to 
improve between the test and 3-month follow-
up, while self-confidence appeared to be fairly 
stable after learning (post-intervention) (14). 
Another possible explanation is that increasing 

self-confidence is a prerequisite for effectively 

dealing with self-criticism. As reflected in this 
intervention, self-belief is thought to play an 
important role in activating secondary 
mechanisms of action, including self-criticism 

(13-16). Self-reassurance develops from the 
interpersonal experiences of caring for and 
nurturing others and the possibility of seeking 
and getting cared for when needed. Depending 
on the experiences, children develop self-critical 
as well as self-reassuring schemas. How a person 
responds to events in which schemas become 
activated depends on individual differences in 

interpersonal experiences. Following Gilbert's 
conceptualization of self-criticism, they have 
higher levels of trait self-criticism as they tend to 
rely on dominant-submissive interpersonal 
schemes with others and, therefore, in their self-
to-self relationship. This implies a self-critical 
mode rather than a compassionate and kind self-

to-self approach (9). One limitation of this study 
is the limited number of people in each group, 
making it difficult to generalize the results. 
Another limitation of this study was the use of 
self-reported measures, treatment performance, 
and intervention-related ratings. Further 
investigation and empirical research to 

overcome the indicated limitations could 
uncover new insights and thus establish a 
stronger foundation for the therapeutic 
interventions mentioned. One of the reasons why 
the sample was limited is the performance of 
dialogue tasks between two chairs and an empty 
chair. This method is more difficult to perform 
in the presence of many people because it 

requires effective implementation in the 
presence of all. For this reason, the high sample 
count led to emotional suppression and a lack of 
proper emotional processing by those in the 
emotional therapy group. 

 It is necessary to conduct further research on 
the effectiveness of the method used in this study 

across a wider range and population base to 
ensure its applicability. Counselors arrange 
regular telephone consultations for people with 
social anxiety disorders, and these people can 
receive support to improve their mental health. 
Future longitudinal studies could evaluate 
emotion-focused therapy for maladaptive 

emotions and shame-based emotional memories 
in patients with social anxiety disorder. 
 

Conclusion 
 Based on the findings, emotion-focused 
therapy reduced self-criticism/reassurance and 
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social anxiety symptoms in patients with social 
anxiety disorder. 
Acknowledgements 

  The authors thank all participants in this study. 

The present study was approved by  
the Ethical Committee of Guilan University 

 (code: IR. GUILAN. REC. 1401. 012). The 
authors declare no conflicts of interest or 
funding. 
 

 

References 
1. Kalin NH. The critical relationship between anxiety and depression. Am J Psychiatry 2020; 177(5): 365-7. 
2. Dixon ML, Moodie CA, Goldin PR, Farb N, Heimberg RG, Gross JJ. Emotion regulation in social anxiety 

disorder: reappraisal and acceptance of negative self-beliefs. Biol Psychiatry Cogn Neurosci Neuroimaging 2020; 

5(1): 119-29. 
3. Ko CY, Chang Y. Investigating the relationships among resilience, social anxiety, and procrastination in a 

sample of college students. Psychol Rep 2019; 122(1): 231-45. 
4. Goldin PR, Morrison A, Jazaieri H, Brozovich F, Heimberg R, Gross JJ. Group CBT versus MBSR for social 

anxiety disorder: A randomized controlled trial. J Consult Clin Psychol 2016; 84(5): 427-37.  

5. Pittelkow MM, Aan Het Rot M, Seidel LJ, Feyel N, Roest AM. Social anxiety and empathy: A systematic 

review and meta-analysis. J Anxiety Disord 2021; 78: 102357.  

6. Butler RM, Boden MT, Olino TM, Morrison AS, Goldin PR, Gross JJ, et al. Emotional clarity and attention 
to emotions in cognitive behavioral group therapy and mindfulness-based stress reduction for social anxiety 

disorder. J Anxiety Disord 2018; 55: 31-8. 

7. Iancu I, Bodner E, Ben-Zion IZ. Self-esteem, dependency, self-efficacy and self-criticism in social anxiety 

disorder. Compr Psychiatry 2015; 58: 165-71. 

8. Shahar B. Emotion-focused therapy for the treatment of social anxiety: An overview of the model and a case 

description. Clin Psychol Psychother 2014; 21(6): 536-47. 

9. Gilbert P, McEwan K, Catarino F, Baião R, Palmeira L. Fears of happiness and compassion in relationship 

with depression, alexithymia, and attachment security in a depressed sample. Br J Clin Psychol 2014; 53(2): 228-

44. 

10. Petrocchi N, Dentale F, Gilbert P. Self‐reassurance, not self‐esteem, serves as a buffer between self‐criticism 
and depressive symptoms. Psychol Psychother 2019; 92(3): 394-406. 

11. Matos M, Duarte C, Duarte J, Pinto-Gouveia J, Petrocchi N, Basran J, et al. Psychological and physiological 

effects of compassionate mind training: A pilot randomized controlled study. Mindfulness 2017; 8: 1699-712. 

12. Matos M, Duarte J, Duarte C, Gilbert P, Pinto-Gouveia J. How one experiences and embodies compassionate 

mind training influences its effectiveness. Mindfulness 2018; 9: 1224-35. 

13. Sommers-Spijkerman MP, Trompetter HR, Schreurs KM, Bohlmeijer ET. Compassion-focused therapy as 

guided self-help for enhancing public mental health: A randomized controlled trial. J Consult Clin Psychol 2018; 

86(2): 101. 

14. Sommers-Spijkerman M, Trompetter H, Ten Klooster P, Schreurs K, Gilbert P, Bohlmeijer E. Development 

and validation of the forms of Self-Criticizing/Attacking and Self-Reassuring Scale—Short Form. Psychol Assess 

2018; 30(6): 729. 

15. Sommers-Spijkerman M, Trompetter H, Schreurs K, Bohlmeijer E. Pathways to improving mental health in 

compassion-focused therapy: Self-reassurance, self-criticism and affect as mediators of Change. Front Psychol 

2018; 9: 2442. 

16. Haberman A, Shahar B, Bar-Kalifa E, Zilcha-Mano S, Diamond GM. Exploring the process of change in 

emotion-focused therapy for social anxiety. Psychother Res 2019; 29(7): 908-18. 

17. Timulak L, McElvaney J, Keogh D, Martin E, Clare P, Chepukova E, et al. Emotion-focused therapy for 
generalized anxiety disorder: An exploratory study. Psychotherapy 2017; 54(4): 361. 

18. Thompson S, Girz L. Overcoming shame and aloneness: Emotion-focused group therapy for self-criticism. 

Person-centered and experiential psychotherapies 2020; 19(1): 1-11. 

19. Behvandi N, Khayatan F, Golparvar M. [Comparing of compassion-based emotion focused therapy with 

compassion-focused treatment on quality of life of primary headache patients]. Iranian journal of psychiatry and 

clinical psychology 2022; 28(2): 210-21. (Persian) 

20. Salarirad Z, Leilabadi L, Salehi M, Kraskian Mujembari A. Effectiveness of emotion-focused therapy on 

anxiety and quality of life in women with breast cancer. Iranian journal of health psychology 2022; 5(3): 35-46. 

21. Vidal J, Soldevilla JM. Effect of compassion-focused therapy on self-criticism and self-soothing: A meta-

analysis. Br J Clin Psychol 2023; 62(1): 70-81. 

22. First MB, Williams JB, Karg RS, Spitzer RL. User's guide for the SCID-5-CV Structured Clinical Interview 

for DSM-5® disorders: Clinical version. Washington. D.C.: American Psychiatric Association; 2016. 

23. Elliott R, Shahar B. Emotion-focused therapy for social anxiety (EFT-SA). Person-centered and experiential 

psychotherapies 2017; 16(2): 140-58. 

http://jfmh.mums.ac.ir/


EMOTION-FOCUSED THERAPY AND SOCIAL ANXIETY DISORDER                                                                ZOHRABI ET AL  

Fundamentals of Mental Health, 2023 Nov-Dec                                                            http://jfmh.mums.ac.ir  417 

24. Connor KM, Davidson JR, Churchill LE, Sherwood A, Weisler RH, Foa E. Psychometric properties of the 

Social Phobia Inventory (SPIN): New self-rating scale. Br J Psychiatry 2000; 176(4): 379-86. 

25. Abdi M. [Cognitive biases in interpretation in people with social phobia]. Dissertation. Tehran: Iran University 

of Medical Sciences, 2003. (Persian) 

26. Gilbert P, Clarke M, Hempel S, Miles JN, Irons C. Criticizing and reassuring oneself: An exploration of forms, 

styles and reasons in female students. Br J Clin Psychol 2004; 43(1): 31-50. 

27. Saadati A, Mazboohi S, Marzi S. [A confirmatory factor analysis and validation of the forms of self-

criticism/reassurance scale among teachers]. Quarterly of educational measurement 2018; 9: 133-47. (Persian) 
28. Homayouni S, Taghavi MR, Goodarzi MA, Hadianfard H. [The efficacy of emotion focused therapy on worry 

and self-criticism in individuals with generalized anxiety disorder]. Journal of psychological science 2022; 21: 1-

8. (Persian) 

29. Shahar B, Doron G, Szepsenwol O. Childhood maltreatment, shame-proneness and self-criticism in social 

anxiety disorder: A sequential mediational model. Clin Psychol Psychother 2015; 22(6): 570-9. 

30. Timulak L, Keogh D, Chigwedere C, Wilson C, Ward F, Hevey D, et al. A comparison of emotion-focused 

therapy and cognitive-behavioral therapy in the treatment of generalized anxiety disorder: Results of a feasibility 

randomized controlled trial. Psychotherapy 2022; 59(1): 84. 

 

 
 

http://jfmh.mums.ac.ir/

